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From the author of Multiple Exposure, an “assured tale of love, loss, and secret agendas” (Publishers
Weekly), comes the second novel in the thrilling Sophie Medina series, following a photojournalist as she
races to find an international treasure before a murderer finds her.

When freelance photojournalist Sophie Medina finds Brother Kevin Boyle, a Franciscan friar and
controversial environmentalist, dead in the magnificent gardens of a Washington, DC monastery, she is sure
her friend was murdered. Shortly before he died, Kevin told Sophie he was being stalked, possibly because
he uncovered a botanic discovery potentially worth millions of dollars. Left with few clues to his secret,
Sophie is determined to figure out who killed Kevin.

Beginning with a key that leads to a priceless original seventeenth-century encyclopedia of plants, Sophie
leaps into an international treasure hunt following a trail that begins in the US Capitol and eventually leads to
London and the English countryside. Before long Sophie suspects Kevin’s murderer may have been someone
who knew him well. With time running out and a suspect list that includes the world’s leading botanical
experts and political royalty from both sides of the Atlantic, can Sophie solve the two-hundred-year-old
mystery before Kevin’s killer finds her?

A tale of greed and betrayal involving politicians, diplomats, European royalty, and a century-old monastery,
Ghost Image is filled with political intrigue, history, and an international high-stakes race against a killer that
will keep you guessing until the very last page.
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From reader reviews:

Gary Sandler:

What do you about book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what the one you have problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy
particular person? If you don't have spare time to do others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And
you have time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They need to answer that
question since just their can do that. It said that about guide. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is right.
Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this kind of Ghost Image: A Sophie Medina
Mystery to read.

Jorge Eaton:

The ability that you get from Ghost Image: A Sophie Medina Mystery will be the more deep you searching
the information that hide inside words the more you get considering reading it. It does not mean that this
book is hard to know but Ghost Image: A Sophie Medina Mystery giving you thrill feeling of reading. The
writer conveys their point in particular way that can be understood by anyone who read the idea because the
author of this reserve is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your own personal vocabulary
increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are
available. We advise you for having this kind of Ghost Image: A Sophie Medina Mystery instantly.

Rhonda Silva:

Reading a book being new life style in this season; every people loves to go through a book. When you
examine a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what forms
of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your review, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these us novel, comics, as well as
soon. The Ghost Image: A Sophie Medina Mystery will give you new experience in looking at a book.

Nicholas Mishler:

A lot of publication has printed but it differs. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the
most beneficial book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is named of
book Ghost Image: A Sophie Medina Mystery. You can contribute your knowledge by it. Without departing
the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most significant that, you
must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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