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Most people familiar with the name Bernie Webber associate him with the miraculous rescue of 32 men off
of the stern of the Pendleton, made famous in the book and movie The Finest Hours. Rescuing 32 sailors
from a sinking ship caught in a ferocious winter storm is a dramatic tale, but what made this mission so
special is that the boat Bernie skippered that terrible night was a mere 36 feet in length and the waves were
almost twice that size! Bernie and crew received the Coast Guard’s coveted Gold Lifesaving Medal, and
what they did on that stormy night is regarded as the greatest small boat rescue in history.
In Into A Raging Sea, Bernie tells that story, but the book is so much more than that. In these pages you’ll
read about rescue attempts that did not turn out well, stories of fishermen from a time long past, rescues done
with the by-gone technique of the “breeches buoy,” humorous anecdotes, and what Cape Cod and its people
meant to Bernie.
Into a Raging Sea is a story of sacrifice, bravery, disappointment, and challenges. And in the background of
Bernie’s journey is one constant, the sea.
--from the forward by Michael J. Tougias
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From reader reviews:

Latasha Sutterfield:

What do you regarding book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your time? Or are you busy particular
person? If you don't have spare time to perform others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored
faster. And you have time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. The doctor has to
answer that question since just their can do this. It said that about publication. Book is familiar on every
person. Yes, it is correct. Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this kind of Into a
Raging Sea: My Life and the Pendleton Rescue to read.

Linda Sandoval:

The publication untitled Into a Raging Sea: My Life and the Pendleton Rescue is the book that recommended
to you to study. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to you actually. The
language that author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The writer was did a lot of
investigation when write the book, hence the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You
also will get the e-book of Into a Raging Sea: My Life and the Pendleton Rescue from the publisher to make
you far more enjoy free time.

Bernice Martinez:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
anyone to understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information much easier
to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book,
and soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended to you personally is Into a Raging Sea: My Life and the Pendleton Rescue this publication
consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world now. This book was represented how does
the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand.
Often the writer made some research when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book appropriate
all of you.

Kathryn Hill:

Is it an individual who having spare time after that spend it whole day simply by watching television
programs or just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Into a Raging Sea: My Life and the
Pendleton Rescue can be the reply, oh how comes? A book you know. You are consequently out of date,
spending your extra time by reading in this completely new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these
publications have than the others?
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