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"Violent scenes in American fiction are not only brutal, bleak, and gratuitous," writes Michael Kowalewski.
"They are also, by turns, comic, witty, poignant, and sometimes, strangely enough, even terrifyingly
beautiful." In this fascinating tour of American fiction, Kowalewski examines incidents ranging from
scalpings and torture in The Deerslayer to fish feeding off human viscera in To Have and Have Not, to show
how highly charged descriptive passages bear on major issues concerning a writer's craft. Instead of focusing
on violence as a socio-cultural phenomenon, he explores how writers including Cooper, Poe, Crane,
Hemingway, Faulkner, Wright, Flannery O'Connor, and Pynchon draw on violence in the realistic imagining
of their works and how their respective styles sustain or counteract this imagining.

Kowalewski begins by offering a new definition of realism, or realistic imagining, and the rhetorical
imagination that seems to oppose it. Then for each author he investigates how scenes of violence exemplify
the stylistic imperatives more generally at work in that writer's fiction. Using violence as the critical occasion
for exploring the distinctive qualities of authorial voice, Deadly Musings addresses the question of what
literary criticism is and ought to be, and how it might apply more usefully to the dynamics of verbal
performance.
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From reader reviews:

Sam Holmes:

The book Deadly Musings give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make
your capable considerably more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting anxiety or
having big problem along with your subject. If you can make studying a book Deadly Musings to get your
habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your
knowledge about a few or all subjects. You may know everything if you like available and read a publication
Deadly Musings. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or other folks. So
, how do you think about this book?

Cicely Silber:

The knowledge that you get from Deadly Musings is the more deep you searching the information that hide
within the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to be
aware of but Deadly Musings giving you thrill feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in a
number of way that can be understood through anyone who read this because the author of this book is well-
known enough. This specific book also makes your own personal vocabulary increase well. Making it easy
to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for
having this specific Deadly Musings instantly.

David Colon:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book thus.
There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new info. When
you read a book you will get new information mainly because book is one of various ways to share the
information or maybe their idea. Second, reading through a book will make anyone more imaginative. When
you reading a book especially fictional book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the people do
it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read this Deadly
Musings, you could tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours publication. Your knowledge
can inspire different ones, make them reading a guide.

Frances Coffey:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got college students? We believe that that
query was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. And
you know that little person similar to reading or as reading through become their hobby. You need to
understand that reading is very important in addition to book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to
add you knowledge, except your own teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update concerning
something by book. A substantial number of sorts of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of
them is Deadly Musings.
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