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The “Slow But Deadly” Dauntless was the US Navy’s premier carrier-borne dive bomber, and proved
immensely successful in all the major Pacific naval campaigns of WW2. Designed by Ed Heinemann, who
later was involved in the design of the equally successful A-20, A-26, F4D and A-4 Skyhawk. The Dauntless
continued on operations until the end of the war, and even post-war with the French and Mexicans. The
SBD’s design and development are covered in detail in this book

The book contains: superb color illustrations of camouflage and markings, rare b/w archive photographs,
scale plans. Essential reading for aviation enthusiasts, historians & scale aeromodellers.
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Slowik:

The book Douglas SBD Dauntless (Yellow Series) make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You can use to
make your capable far more increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting stress or having
big problem along with your subject. If you can make studying a book Douglas SBD Dauntless (Yellow
Series) being your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your own capable, increase
your knowledge about a few or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like start and read a
publication Douglas SBD Dauntless (Yellow Series). Kinds of book are several. It means that, science guide
or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this reserve?

Tod Espitia:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As we know that book is
very important for people. The book Douglas SBD Dauntless (Yellow Series) was making you to know
about other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It is very advantages for you. The
reserve Douglas SBD Dauntless (Yellow Series) is not only giving you a lot more new information but also
for being your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your e-book. Try to
make relationship using the book Douglas SBD Dauntless (Yellow Series). You never truly feel lose out for
everything when you read some books.

Mark Blanding:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, small story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not attempting Douglas SBD Dauntless
(Yellow Series) that give your entertainment preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading
habit all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world better then how they react in
the direction of the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading habit only for the geeky individual but
for all of you who wants to possibly be success person. So , for all of you who want to start examining as
your good habit, you can pick Douglas SBD Dauntless (Yellow Series) become your personal starter.

Martin Dowling:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many question for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people likes
examining, not only science book but novel and Douglas SBD Dauntless (Yellow Series) or perhaps others
sources were given expertise for you. After you know how the fantastic a book, you feel would like to read
more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those textbooks are
helping them to increase their knowledge. In different case, beside science publication, any other book likes
Douglas SBD Dauntless (Yellow Series) to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book
like this one.
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