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For anyone interested in history, the physical traces of the past, especially historical places, hold a special
fascination. Whether it is a battlefield or the home of a notable American, there is no question that we
understand the past in a different and more immediate way when we encounter it "on the ground."
In American Places, more than two dozen of America's most gifted historians write about their own
encounters with historic places, bringing a personal viewpoint to bear on a wide variety of sites, ranging
from Monticello to Fenway Park. Here James M. McPherson writes about the battlefield of Gettysburg, and
how walking the ground of Pickett's Charge inspired one of his books. Kevin Starr visits the Musso & Frank
Grill in Hollywood and finds many of the flavors of California history there. Joel Williamson takes a
bemused tour of Elvis Presley's Graceland, and David Kennedy tells the story of the "Pig War" of San Juan
Island, where a spat between Britain and America over a speck of land in the Pacific helped determine the
shape of the U.S. and Canada. William Freehling compares two places, Charleston's Battery and New
Orleans' Jackson Square, showing how each reveals the different spirit of the society that created it. And
Edward Ayers talks about spending time in Cyberspace, U.S.A., a virtual place that has much in common
with the America visited by Alexis de Tocqueville a century and a half ago. Other pieces include Robert
Dallek on the FDR Memorial, David Hackett Fischer on the Boston Common, and William Leuchtenburg on
his native borough of Queens.
American Places celebrates the career of Sheldon Meyer, who over his years at Oxford University Press has
published some of our most distinguished historians, including many Pulitzer Prize and Bancroft Prize
winners, virtually all of whom have contributed to this volume.
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From reader reviews:

Eugene Obrien:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading routine give
you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the
book that improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of publication
you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want sense happy read
one using theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The American Places: Encounters with History is
kind of book which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Marcy Madison:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book particularly book entitled
American Places: Encounters with History your thoughts will drift away trough every dimension, wandering
in every aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely might be your mind friends. Imaging each word
written in a publication then become one application form conclusion and explanation that maybe you never
get prior to. The American Places: Encounters with History giving you another experience more than blown
away your brain but also giving you useful details for your better life on this era. So now let us show you the
relaxing pattern this is your body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished examining it, like
winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling out spare time activity?

Geraldine Louis:

You could spend your free time to read this book this e-book. This American Places: Encounters with
History is simple to develop you can read it in the area, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not
include much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you much
easier to read it. You can save typically the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of
benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Marcela Beach:

You can get this American Places: Encounters with History by go to the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or
reviewing it could possibly to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this
e-book are various. Not only by simply written or printed and also can you enjoy this book by simply e-book.
In the modern era such as now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and searching what their
problem. Right now, choose your current ways to get more information about your publication. It is most
important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose appropriate ways
for you.
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