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A fresh perspective on what it takes to run a moneymaking small business

If you're a small business owner, you probably started out with a great idea, an entrepreneurial dream, and
the willingness to work as hard as you have to. You're up-and-running, your products and services are
selling, and you are working as hard as you can. But where do you go from here? How do you get there?
And how can you be sure your business will make you money now and for the long term?

Found Money presents a new and powerful approach to small-business success. It helps you figure out,
instantly, whether your business is on-track or flying off the rails (and how to correct it if it is flying off the
rails). Not only does it help you understand how your business makes you money, but how to control that
process as well. It offers accessible, easy-to-use tools and tactics to help you understand the links between
what happens in your small business and the financial results you achieve so you can proactively create the
financial results you want.

Helps you maximize the money your small business makes by showing you where additional profit and●

cash flow is hiding right now in your business
Steve Wilkinghoff is an accountant and consultant who helps businesses reach their full, money-making●

potential
Foreword by Michael Gerber, preeminent small business guru●

If you own your own small business but don't know how to take control of the financial results it gives you,
Found Money hands you the strategies, tactics and tools you need to take control, and direct and maximize
the money-making process.
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From reader reviews:

Nathan Jackson:

The book Found Money: Simple Strategies for Uncovering the Hidden Profit and Cash Flow in Your
Business can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want.
Why must we leave a good thing like a book Found Money: Simple Strategies for Uncovering the Hidden
Profit and Cash Flow in Your Business? Some of you have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim in
which book can give many info for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer using your book.
Knowledge or information that you take for that, you could give for each other; you could share all of these.
Book Found Money: Simple Strategies for Uncovering the Hidden Profit and Cash Flow in Your Business
has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and big function for you. You can appearance the
enormous world by available and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Mary Rohe:

This Found Money: Simple Strategies for Uncovering the Hidden Profit and Cash Flow in Your Business
book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you
receive by reading this book is usually information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get data
which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get. This specific Found Money:
Simple Strategies for Uncovering the Hidden Profit and Cash Flow in Your Business without we understand
teach the one who studying it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry
Found Money: Simple Strategies for Uncovering the Hidden Profit and Cash Flow in Your Business can
bring when you are and not make your tote space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it
with your lovely laptop even cell phone. This Found Money: Simple Strategies for Uncovering the Hidden
Profit and Cash Flow in Your Business having good arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not
truly feel uninterested in reading.

Darlene Goins:

This Found Money: Simple Strategies for Uncovering the Hidden Profit and Cash Flow in Your Business is
new way for you who has curiosity to look for some information because it relief your hunger associated
with. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still having small
amount of digest in reading this Found Money: Simple Strategies for Uncovering the Hidden Profit and Cash
Flow in Your Business can be the light food in your case because the information inside this particular book
is easy to get through anyone. These books produce itself in the form which can be reachable by anyone, yes
I mean in the e-book web form. People who think that in guide form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this
guide is the answer. So there is not any in reading a book especially this one. You can find what you are
looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss that! Just read this e-book style for your better life
along with knowledge.



Marie Miles:

On this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more treasured
than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you have to do is
just spending your time not much but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of the books in the
top list in your reading list is definitely Found Money: Simple Strategies for Uncovering the Hidden Profit
and Cash Flow in Your Business. This book which can be qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer
in turning out to be precious person. By looking way up and review this book you can get many advantages.
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