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Antoinette Tuff's Courage and Faith Prevented Tragedy in a School Under Siege.

870 children waited in fear as their elementary school rushed into lockdown mode. As the nation faced yet
another Sandy Hook story of tragedy, one woman rewrote the ending.

Yet the story doesn't start with those first steps Michael Hill took into that Atlanta elementary school. It
starts with Antoinette Tuff, a woman who faced her own pain, hurt, and rejection, yet held onto grace, faith,
and hope. A hope that anchored her in the most high-stakes moments, a grace that allowed her to empathize
with a hurting young man, and a faith that gave her the courage to love him back from the brink.

This is more than just the amazing account of tragedy averted. It's the evidence of what we can do when we
allow ourselves to be used by God. And it's a story of how God uses all of our life experiences--the good and
the bad--to prepare us for our own moment of divine purpose.

"Not only did she make Michelle and me very proud, but she probably saved a lot of lives."--President
Obama

"We should use her example to teach our children's leaders--any of our leaders, really, and all of our
children--the value of compassion and the power of empathy."--The Washington Post

"She is a reminder of what Christian courage looks like: She didn't need a weapon, just her faith and a
willingness to love the unlovable and to share her own pain, failures, and struggles, knowing that the rest was
in God's hands."--Eric Metaxes, BreakPoint

"She was a real hero in all of this. She just did a stellar job. She was cool, she was calm, very collected,
maintained her wherewithal."--Fox News

". . . an amazing illustration of calm and brinkmanship . . ."--The Guardian

"The fascination at the heart of Tuff's tale, the reason it's riveting, is the way she used compassion and
empathy to disarm a mentally ill man intent on killing."--Salon.com
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From reader reviews:

Phyllis Spencer:

Now a day people who Living in the era where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources included can be true or not demand people to be aware of each info they get. How people have to
be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Examining a
book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Prepared for a Purpose: The Inspiring
True Story of How One Woman Saved an Atlanta School Under Siege book as this book offers you rich facts
and knowledge. Of course the information in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it
everbody knows.

Ruth Ford:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone in everywhere.
The information can be a expertise or any news even a huge concern. What people must be consider
whenever those information which is inside the former life are hard to be find than now's taking seriously
which one works to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you get the unstable
resource then you obtain it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Prepared for a Purpose: The Inspiring True Story of How
One Woman Saved an Atlanta School Under Siege as your daily resource information.

Edmund Morrissette:

The book Prepared for a Purpose: The Inspiring True Story of How One Woman Saved an Atlanta School
Under Siege will bring someone to the new experience of reading the book. The author style to elucidate the
idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book to read, this book very suited to you. The book Prepared
for a Purpose: The Inspiring True Story of How One Woman Saved an Atlanta School Under Siege is much
recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book from the official web site, so you can more readily
to read the book.

Nancy Chinn:

Many people spending their period by playing outside having friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by reading through a
book. Ugh, do you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It
fine you can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Prepared for a
Purpose: The Inspiring True Story of How One Woman Saved an Atlanta School Under Siege which is
finding the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's observe.
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