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This is the sixth volume of Dr. Justin Glenn’s comprehensive history that traces the “Presidential line” of the
Washingtons. Volume One began with the immigrant John Washington, who settled in Westmoreland Co.,
Va., in 1657, married Anne Pope, and became the great-grandfather of President George Washington. It
continued the record of their descendants for a total of seven generations. Volume Two highlighted notable
family members in the next eight generations of John and Anne Washington’s descendants. Volume Three
traced the ancestry of the early Virginia members of this “Presidential Branch” back to the aristocracy and
nobility of England and continental Europe. Volume Four resumed the family history where Volume One
ended, and it contained Generation Eight of the immigrant John Washington’s descendants. Volume Five
treated Generation Nine.

Volume Six now presents Generation Ten, and it includes over 12,000 descendants. Future volumes will add
generations eleven through fifteen, making a total of over 63,000 descendants. Although structured in a
genealogical format for the sake of clarity, this is no bare bones genealogy but a true family history with over
1,200 detailed biographical narratives. These in turn strive to convey the greatness of the family that
produced not only The Father of His Country but many others, great and humble, who struggled to build that
country.

Volume Six, Part One covers the descendants of the Immigrant John Washington’s children Lawrence
Washington and John Washington, Jr. Volume Six, Part Two covers the descendants of the Immigrant’s
child Anne (Washington) Wright.

REVIEWS

“I am convinced that your work will be of wide interest to historians and academics as well as members of
the Washington family itself. Although the surname Washington is perhaps the best known in American
history and much has been written about the Washington family for well over a century, it is surprising that
no comprehensive family history has been published. Justin M. Glenn’s The Washingtons: A Family History
finally fills this void for the branch to which General and President George Washington belonged,
identifying some 63,000 descendants. This is truly a family history, not a mere tabulation of names and
dates, providing biographical accounts of many of the descendants of John Washington who settled in
Westmoreland County, Virginia, in 1657.” ? John Frederick Dorman, editor of The Virginia Genealogist
(1957-2006) and author of Adventurers of Purse and Person
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From reader reviews:

Jodi Saldana:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add
your knowledge by the publication entitled The Washingtons. Volume 6, Part 1: Generation Ten of the
Presidential Branch (The Washingtons: A Family History). Try to the actual book The Washingtons. Volume
6, Part 1: Generation Ten of the Presidential Branch (The Washingtons: A Family History) as your buddy. It
means that it can to get your friend when you truly feel alone and beside regarding course make you smarter
than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you a lot more confidence because
you can know everything by the book. So , let us make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Therese McGaha:

What do you regarding book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material if you want
something to explain what your own problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy man or woman?
If you don't have spare time to perform others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have spare
time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They must answer that question simply
because just their can do which. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is proper.
Because start from on guardería until university need this The Washingtons. Volume 6, Part 1: Generation
Ten of the Presidential Branch (The Washingtons: A Family History) to read.

Shawn Francis:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this The Washingtons. Volume 6, Part 1:
Generation Ten of the Presidential Branch (The Washingtons: A Family History) book written by well-
known writer who really knows well how to make book which might be understand by anyone who else read
the book. Written with good manner for you, leaking every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate your
own personal hunger then you still skepticism The Washingtons. Volume 6, Part 1: Generation Ten of the
Presidential Branch (The Washingtons: A Family History) as good book not merely by the cover but also
with the content. This is one reserve that can break don't ascertain book by its include, so do you still needing
an additional sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already said so why you
have to listening to yet another sixth sense.

Allison Morales:

You are able to spend your free time to read this book this book. This The Washingtons. Volume 6, Part 1:
Generation Ten of the Presidential Branch (The Washingtons: A Family History) is simple to develop you
can read it in the park, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not include much space to bring often the
printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save the particular
book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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