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"1+1=3. That is the equation that summarizes the theme of this book. The book’s message is to integrate the
developmental principles of Agile with the result-focused approaches integral to performance consulting.
Your outcomes in shaping human performance will be significant--and greater than if you only used one of
these models. This is a book for anyone who seeks to work collaboratively with leaders to bring about
continuously improving and sustainable organizational change." --Dana Gaines Robinson, coauthor of
Performance Consulting

Agile Performance Improvement demonstrates the mutual benefits that accrue to the worlds of performance
consulting and agile software development when the values and principles of both are blended
synergistically under the guidance of practitioners skilled in both. The agile performance improvement
model blends the principles of human performance technology with the frameworks and practices of Agile.
The result is an approach that maximizes the value of interactions among the consultant, the work team, and
the customer. Unlike traditional end-to-end waterfall processes, agile performance improvement delivers
value continuously and in small increments, relentlessly focusing on outcomes of value to the customer.
Building on structures of Agile that are used in software development, such as Scrum, the agile performance
improvement model considers the human component of holistic solutions in establishing a continuous stream
of value.

Bob Winter, a performance consultant, was the product owner for the corporate education scrum supporting
an agile transition initiative for hundreds of engineering teams. From this cross-disciplinary experience, he
discovered that the two cultures, two languages, and two methodologies of performance consulting and agile
software development are—far from being incongruent, incompatible, or irrelevant to each other—in fact
ideally suited to complement and support each other. Being agile improves the effectiveness of the
performance consultant, and applying the lessons of human performance technology improves the
effectiveness of software development teams.

In Agile Performance Improvement, Winter teaches performance consultants how to apply agile principles,
values, and methods usefully to the tasks of optimizing human performance in areas of practice not only
adjoining but also well beyond the realm of software and IT engineering, such as corporate learning
solutions, human resources systems, and non-software products. Conversely, he shows engineering teams
immersed in an agile environment how to boost their performance using the principles and techniques taught
and cultivated by performance consultants. The author, who has worked extensively on both sides of the
traditional divide, recounts entertainingly but informatively how both sparks and fur can fly when geeks
encounter people people.

What you’ll learn

After reading this book, business executives, team members, agile practitioners, and performance consulting



practitioners will be able to do the following:

Avoid the common pitfalls faced by teams transitioning from traditional work methods t
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From reader reviews:
Deborah Hart:As people who live in the actual modest era should be up-date about what going on or facts
even knowledge to make these keep up with the era that is certainly always change and advance. Some of
you maybe can update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the
problems coming to you actually is you don't know what one you should start with. This Agile Performance
Improvement: The New Synergy of Agile and Human Performance Technology is our recommendation to
help you keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and need in this era.
Steven Kilgore:People live in this new day time of lifestyle always try to and must have the time or they will
get lot of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , whenever we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we ask again, what kind of
activity do you have when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer can unlimited right.
Then do you ever try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time,
the particular book you have read is actually Agile Performance Improvement: The New Synergy of Agile
and Human Performance Technology.
Carlos Reese:This Agile Performance Improvement: The New Synergy of Agile and Human Performance
Technology is brand new way for you who has attention to look for some information since it relief your
hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you know otherwise you who still
having small amount of digest in reading this Agile Performance Improvement: The New Synergy of Agile
and Human Performance Technology can be the light food for you personally because the information inside
that book is easy to get simply by anyone. These books create itself in the form which can be reachable by
anyone, yes I mean in the e-book contact form. People who think that in book form make them feel drowsy
even dizzy this publication is the answer. So there is no in reading a book especially this one. You can find
actually looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss it! Just read this e-book type for your
better life as well as knowledge.
Robert Alleman:You can get this Agile Performance Improvement: The New Synergy of Agile and Human
Performance Technology by browse the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it can to be your solve
challenge if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this book are various. Not only by written or
printed but in addition can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era just like now, you just looking
by your local mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your current ways to get
more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge
are still change. Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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