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The Roman emperor Commodus wanted to kill a rhinoceros with a bow and arrow, and he wanted to do it in
the Colosseum. Commodus' passion for hunting animals was so fervent that he dreamt of shooting a tiger, an
elephant, and a hippopotamus; his prowess was such that people claimed he never missed when hurling his
javelin or firing arrows from his bow. For fourteen days near the end of AD 192, the emperor mounted one
of the most lavish and spectacular gladiatorial games Rome had ever seen. Commodus himself was the star
attraction, and people rushed from all over Italy to witness the spectacle. But this slaughter was simply the
warm-up act to the main event: the emperor was also planning to fight as a gladiator. Why did Roman rulers
spend vast resources on such over-the-top displays - and why did some emperors appear in them as
combatants? Why did the Roman rabble enjoy watching the slaughter of animals and the sight of men
fighting to the death? And how best can we in the modern world understand what was truly at stake in the
circus and the arena?
In The Day Commodus Killed a Rhino, Jerry Toner set out to answer these questions by vividly describing
what it would have been like to attend Commodus' fantastic shows and watch one of his many appearances
as both hunter and fighter. Highlighting the massive logistical effort needed to supply the games with
animals, performers, and criminals for execution, the book reveals how blood and gore were actually
incidental to what really mattered. Gladiatorial games played a key role in establishing a forum for political
debate between the rulers and the ruled. Roman crowds were not passive: they were made up of sophisticated
consumers with their own political aims, which they used the games to secure. In addition, the games also
served as a pure expression of what it meant to be a true Roman. Drawing on notions of personal honor,
manly vigor, and sophisticated craftsmanship, the games were a story that the Romans loved to tell
themselves about themselves.
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From reader reviews:

Mary McKay:

This book untitled The Day Commodus Killed a Rhino (Witness to Ancient History) to be one of several
books that will best seller in this year, this is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit
on it. You will easily to buy this specific book in the book shop or you can order it by using online. The
publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, since you can read
this book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this e-book from your list.

Christopher Forney:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book thus. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
data. When you read a reserve you will get new information due to the fact book is one of a number of ways
to share the information or even their idea. Second, reading a book will make you actually more imaginative.
When you reading through a book especially hype book the author will bring someone to imagine the story
how the characters do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other people. When you read this
The Day Commodus Killed a Rhino (Witness to Ancient History), you could tells your family, friends and
also soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a publication.

Rita Lattimore:

Typically the book The Day Commodus Killed a Rhino (Witness to Ancient History) has a lot of information
on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was published by
the very famous author. The writer makes some research prior to write this book. This particular book very
easy to read you may get the point easily after reading this book.

Deanne Mohammed:

Is it you actually who having spare time in that case spend it whole day through watching television
programs or just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Day Commodus Killed a Rhino
(Witness to Ancient History) can be the respond to, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are thus
out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this brand new era is common not a geek activity. So
what these ebooks have than the others?
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