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“Gilbert Sorrentino has long been one of our most intelligent and daring writers. But he is also one of our
funniest writers, given to Joycean flights of wordplay, punning, list-making, vulgarity and relentless self-
commentary.”—The New York Times

“Sorrentino’s ear for dialects and metaphor is perfect: his creations, however brief their presence, are vivid,
and much of his writing is very funny and clever, piled with allusions.”—The Washington Post Book World

Bearing his trademark balance between exquisitely detailed narration, ground-breaking form, and sharp
insight into modern life, Gilbert Sorrentino’s first-ever collection of stories spans 35 years of his writing
career and contains both new stories and those that expanded and transformed the landscape of American
fiction when they first appeared in such magazines and anthologies as Harper’s, Esquire, and The Best
American Short Stories.

In these grimly comic, unsentimental tales, the always-memorable characters dive headlong into the
wasteland of urban culture, seeking out banal perversions, confusing art with the art scene, mistaking lust for
love, and letting petty aspirations get the best of them. This is a world where the American dream is
embodied in the moonlit cocktail hour and innocence passes at a breakneck speed, swiftly becoming a
nostalgia-ridden cliché. As Sorrentino says in the title story, “art cannot rescue anybody from anything,” but
his stories do offer some salvation to each of us by locating hope, humor, and beauty amidst a prevailing
wind of cynical despair.

Gilbert Sorrentino has published over 20 books of fiction and poetry, including the classic Mulligan Stew and
his latest novel, Little Casino, which was shortlisted for the 2003 PEN/Faulkner Award. After two decades
on the faculty at Stanford University, he recently returned to his native Brooklyn.
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From reader reviews:

Teresa Howard:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that will give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world can share their idea.
Books can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their very own reader with their story or
maybe their experience. Not only situation that share in the guides. But also they write about the information
about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach children, there are
many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their talent in writing, they
also doing some exploration before they write for their book. One of them is this The Moon in Its Flight.

Anna Chew:

The book The Moon in Its Flight has a lot details on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get
a lot of profit. The book was compiled by the very famous author. Tom makes some research ahead of write
this book. This kind of book very easy to read you may get the point easily after reading this article book.

Brenda Robert:

You will get this The Moon in Its Flight by visit the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it could to
be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only
by means of written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern era
including now, you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose
your own personal ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most important to arrange you to
ultimately make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose right ways for you.

Benjamin Munk:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information originating from a book. Book is composed or printed or outlined from each source in which
filled update of news. On this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you
actually. From media social such as newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference
book, novel and comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time
to spread out your book? Or just trying to find the The Moon in Its Flight when you essential it?
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