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ScratchJr is a free, introductory computer programming language that runs on iPads and Android tablets.
Inspired by Scratch, the wildly popular programming language used by millions of children worldwide,
ScratchJr helps even younger kids create their own playful animations, interactive stories, and dynamic
games.

The Official ScratchJr Book is the perfect companion to this free app and makes coding easy and fun for all.
Kids learn to program by connecting blocks of code to make characters move, jump, dance, and sing.

Each chapter includes several activities that build on one another, culminating in a fun final project. These
hands-on activities help kids develop computational-thinking, problem-solving, and design skills. In each
activity, you'll find:

Step-by-step, easy-to-follow directions●

Ways to connect the activity with literacy and math concepts●

Tips for grown-ups and teachers●

Creative challenges to take the learning further●

By the end of the book, kids will be ready for all sorts of new programming adventures!
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From reader reviews:

Donna Bauer:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the book entitled The Official ScratchJr Book: Help Your Kids Learn to Code. Try to face the
book The Official ScratchJr Book: Help Your Kids Learn to Code as your friend. It means that it can being
your friend when you experience alone and beside that of course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it
is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you can know every little
thing by the book. So , we should make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Daniel Hendrix:

The book The Official ScratchJr Book: Help Your Kids Learn to Code can give more knowledge and
information about everything you want. Why must we leave the best thing like a book The Official ScratchJr
Book: Help Your Kids Learn to Code? Several of you have a different opinion about book. But one aim this
book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer together with your book.
Knowledge or data that you take for that, you can give for each other; it is possible to share all of these.
Book The Official ScratchJr Book: Help Your Kids Learn to Code has simple shape however, you know: it
has great and massive function for you. You can appear the enormous world by start and read a guide. So it
is very wonderful.

Elliott Townsend:

You may spend your free time to learn this book this e-book. This The Official ScratchJr Book: Help Your
Kids Learn to Code is simple to develop you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train along with
soon. If you did not have much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is
make you simpler to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of
benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Erica Lewis:

A lot of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a guide. They are directly felt the idea when
they get a half parts of the book. You can choose the actual book The Official ScratchJr Book: Help Your
Kids Learn to Code to make your own personal reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading skill is
developing when you such as reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to read it and
mingle the impression about book and looking at especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to
open a book and study it. Beside that the book The Official ScratchJr Book: Help Your Kids Learn to Code
can to be your friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse using what must you're doing of that time.
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