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To a large extent, the air cargo market is a B2B service market between air cargo carriers and forwarding
companies. Sellers strive to mitigate risk by engaging in advance sale of capacity via long-term contracts.
However, these contracts often leave buyers with an incentive to default if unforeseen price and demand
movements occur. This work proposes capacity options as an alternative contract type providing the desired
flexibility and shows how capacity can be priced through option contracts. The analysis is conducted by
means of an analytical multivariate optimization model under price and demand uncertainty. An application
case study conducted on the basis of empirical data from a leading German air cargo carrier illustrates the
financial potential. Furthermore, it is shown how capacity-option contracts integrate into the context of air
cargo revenue management.
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From reader reviews:

Matthew German:

Here thing why this particular Capacity Options for Revenue Management: 575 (Lecture Notes in
Economics and Mathematical Systems) are different and dependable to be yours. First of all studying a book
is good nonetheless it depends in the content of computer which is the content is as scrumptious as food or
not. Capacity Options for Revenue Management: 575 (Lecture Notes in Economics and Mathematical
Systems) giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any guide out there but there is no
e-book that similar with Capacity Options for Revenue Management: 575 (Lecture Notes in Economics and
Mathematical Systems). It gives you thrill reading through journey, its open up your current eyes about the
thing that happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. You can easily bring
everywhere like in area, café, or even in your technique home by train. When you are having difficulties in
bringing the printed book maybe the form of Capacity Options for Revenue Management: 575 (Lecture
Notes in Economics and Mathematical Systems) in e-book can be your alternate.

Orville Norman:

This Capacity Options for Revenue Management: 575 (Lecture Notes in Economics and Mathematical
Systems) usually are reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful person, why. The key reason why
of this Capacity Options for Revenue Management: 575 (Lecture Notes in Economics and Mathematical
Systems) can be among the great books you must have will be giving you more than just simple reading
through food but feed you actually with information that maybe will shock your preceding knowledge. This
book is actually handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and whenever your conditions at e-book and
printed kinds. Beside that this Capacity Options for Revenue Management: 575 (Lecture Notes in Economics
and Mathematical Systems) forcing you to have an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving
you test of critical thinking that could it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Pamela Watkins:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their spare time with
their family, or their friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, about to beach, or
picnic inside the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to
something different to fill your free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book is usually option to fill
your free time/ holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you
want to try look for book, may be the reserve untitled Capacity Options for Revenue Management: 575
(Lecture Notes in Economics and Mathematical Systems) can be excellent book to read. May be it is usually
best activity to you.

Ok Lord:

Is it anyone who having spare time and then spend it whole day by means of watching television programs or



just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Capacity Options for Revenue Management:
575 (Lecture Notes in Economics and Mathematical Systems) can be the reply, oh how comes? It's a book
you know. You are thus out of date, spending your free time by reading in this completely new era is
common not a geek activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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