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Dancing out of Line transports readers back to the 1840s when the craze for social and stage dancing forced
Victorians into a complex relationship with the moving body in its most voluble, volatile form. Molly
Engelhardt challenges our assumptions about Victorian sensibilities and attitudes toward the sexual/social
roles of men and women by bringing together historical voices from

various fields to demonstrate the versatility of the dance, not only as a social practice but also as a forum for
Victorians to engage in debate about the body and its pleasures and pathologies.

Engelhardt makes explicit many of the ironies underlying Victorian practices that up to this time have gone
unnoticed in critical circles by partnering cultural discourses with representations of the dance in novels such
as Mansfield Park, Jane Eyre, and Daniel Deronda. She analyzes the role of the illustrious dance master,
who created and disseminated the manners and moves expected of fashionable society, despite his origin as a
social outsider of nebulous origins. She describes how the daughters of the social elite were expected to
“come out” to society in the ballroom, the most potent space in the cultural imagination for licentious
behavior and temptation. These incongruities fueled the debates and in the process generated new,
progressive ideas about the body, subjectivity, sexuality, and health.

Dancing out of Line will be of interest to scholars in the fields of Victorian studies, women’s history, the
nineteenth-century novel, dance and theater studies, and medicine and literature.
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From reader reviews:

Stacey Samuels:

Within other case, little men and women like to read book Dancing out of Line: Ballrooms, Ballets, and
Mobility in Victorian Fiction and Culture. You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book.
Given that we know about how is important a book Dancing out of Line: Ballrooms, Ballets, and Mobility in
Victorian Fiction and Culture. You can add know-how and of course you can around the world by just a
book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can realize everything! From your country until
eventually foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you can know
that. In this era, we can open a book as well as searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You can utilize
it when you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's learn.

Robert Perkins:

The reason? Because this Dancing out of Line: Ballrooms, Ballets, and Mobility in Victorian Fiction and
Culture is an unordinary book that the inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap that but latter it will zap
you with the secret the item inside. Reading this book alongside it was fantastic author who have write the
book in such awesome way makes the content within easier to understand, entertaining technique but still
convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this anymore or you
going to regret it. This unique book will give you a lot of positive aspects than the other book possess such as
help improving your skill and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If
I had been you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Monica Philson:

On this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more important than
other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time little but quite enough to get a look at some books. Among the books in the top collection
in your reading list is Dancing out of Line: Ballrooms, Ballets, and Mobility in Victorian Fiction and
Culture. This book that is qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in turning into precious person.
By looking right up and review this reserve you can get many advantages.

Melvin Schroeder:

A number of people said that they feel fed up when they reading a book. They are directly felt the idea when
they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the book Dancing out of Line: Ballrooms, Ballets, and
Mobility in Victorian Fiction and Culture to make your personal reading is interesting. Your skill of reading
skill is developing when you just like reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to learn it and
mingle the opinion about book and reading through especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to
open a book and study it. Beside that the reserve Dancing out of Line: Ballrooms, Ballets, and Mobility in
Victorian Fiction and Culture can to be your brand-new friend when you're experience alone and confuse



with the information must you're doing of that time.
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