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So you are starting a new business, are an entrepreneur, a work from home professional or a freelancer. You
are enterprising and want to excel at your activity, possibly even develop your own startup. You will get to a
point where, as a businessperson, you will need to draft a contract or enter a negotiation. Every
businessperson will have to at some stage. Successful as you are now, you may not be a lawyer. So how to
decide what to include when writing a business contract?

Business Contracts for Startups and Entrepreneurs was written especially for people like you who want
ensure their legal documents are legally adequate and binding. Do go ahead and use legal aid, but do yourself
and your business a favor by researching what you really need to discuss and what you may not need to. The
idea is to keep focused and not spend time and money on unnecessary items. Start by defining what you will
need to really discuss with your lawyer. How? By reading this eBook.

This eBook is a comprehensive guide that includes over 101 terms and factors to consider when writing a
contract. Straightforward and to the point, it will provide guidance for those unfamiliar with business
agreements.

Lawyers are expensive, especially for startups or a small business with minimal funds. With Business
Contracts for Startups and Entrepreneurs a business owner will be able to cut on legal advice expenses and
complete their own draft contract or negotiation, eventually saving thousands of dollars on lawyers’ fees and
channeling them back to their own startup, dot-com or the like.

Business Contracts for Startups and Entrepreneurs is a practical legal guide. Using it as go to reference book,
small business owners or people starting a business will be able to get a grip on negotiation even before they
seek legal advice.

This eBook is designed as a checklist, so you can quickly read through and see what may or may not be
relevant for your scenario. Here are a few examples of what it covers: Method of Protection of Confidential
Information; Record Keeping; Cooperation of Parties; Assignment and Delegation of Rights and
Obligations; Automatic Renewal.

As you go through the eBook, if the items are relevant then you can include them as part of drafting your
contract. If not, you can simply move on to the next item. Thus, by the time you get legal advice, most items
should be covered, leaving less work for your lawyer and therefore less pain on your hip pocket when you
receive the lawyer’s bill.

Easy to read and clear-cut, How to write a Business Contract for Startups and Entrepreneurs is a must-have
comprehensive legal guide for drafting a contract, starting a business or entering negotiation.



This list of terms and factors to consider when drafting a contract is not an exhaustive list. Rather, the list is
provided merely as guidance for those unfamiliar with contracts. The facts and circumstances of each
individual contractual relationship are unique and may require special contractual provisions in order to
ensure the rights of the parties are adequately protected. You should consult the advice of an attorney
licensed to practice law in your jurisdiction regarding the legality of your contract, as well as your rights and
obligations under the contract. The author does not accept any liability or responsibility for any damages
incurred in connection with or as a result of any of the contract language or recommendations contained
herein.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Johnson:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their spare time with their
family, or all their friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, planning to beach,
or picnic inside the park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to
something different to fill your personal free time/ holiday? May be reading a book is usually option to fill
your free time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If
you want to consider look for book, may be the reserve untitled Business Contracts for Startups and
Entrepreneurs:: a comprehensive checklist with +101 terms and factors to consider when writing a business
plan or entering a negotiation. can be very good book to read. May be it could be best activity to you.

Della Richardson:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Try to pick
one book that you find out the inside because don't determine book by its protect may doesn't work the
following is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside seem
likes. Maybe you answer may be Business Contracts for Startups and Entrepreneurs:: a comprehensive
checklist with +101 terms and factors to consider when writing a business plan or entering a negotiation.
why because the wonderful cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint you. The
inside or content is fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you
to pick up this book.

Aimee Nguyen:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your
mind skill or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book
compared to can satisfy your limited time to read it because this all time you only find publication that need
more time to be read. Business Contracts for Startups and Entrepreneurs:: a comprehensive checklist with
+101 terms and factors to consider when writing a business plan or entering a negotiation. can be your
answer given it can be read by you actually who have those short free time problems.

Inez Tuller:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many problem for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people
likes reading, not only science book but in addition novel and Business Contracts for Startups and
Entrepreneurs:: a comprehensive checklist with +101 terms and factors to consider when writing a business
plan or entering a negotiation. or perhaps others sources were given understanding for you. After you know
how the truly amazing a book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science e-book was created for



teacher or maybe students especially. Those books are helping them to increase their knowledge. In different
case, beside science guide, any other book likes Business Contracts for Startups and Entrepreneurs:: a
comprehensive checklist with +101 terms and factors to consider when writing a business plan or entering a
negotiation. to make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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