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"Said the river to the seeker: 'Does one really have to fret about enlightenment? No matter which way
I turn, I'm homeward bound.'" --Anthony de Mello

We are like bears pacing in a cage, Anthony de Mello says. Even if the cage is removed, we keep pacing in
the same timid limits. We are afraid to get out. And we think that the only way out is by endless striving and
thinking.

But this profound healer and spiritual master shows us another way. The Heart of the Enlightened, the sequel
to the highly successful Taking Flight, contains more than two hundred of de Mello's favorite stories.
Whether Buddhist tales, Hindu fables, Islamic sayings, or Christian parables, the stories de Mello has chosen
are sure to seep through to the heart. They touch on relationships, human nature, service, spirituality, and
enlightenment. These are stories to be read slowly and savored. They are the key to liberating us from all that
would pen us in.
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From reader reviews:

Cedric Baker:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children till adult are different content. We all know that
that book is very important for people. The book Heart of the Enlightened has been making you to know
about other expertise and of course you can take more information. It is very advantages for you. The reserve
Heart of the Enlightened is not only giving you more new information but also being your friend when you
sense bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship with
all the book Heart of the Enlightened. You never feel lose out for everything when you read some books.

Ryan Moore:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a e-book you will get new information simply because book is one of several
ways to share the information or even their idea. Second, reading through a book will make anyone more
imaginative. When you studying a book especially fiction book the author will bring you to definitely
imagine the story how the personas do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to other
individuals. When you read this Heart of the Enlightened, you could tells your family, friends and soon about
yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a guide.

David Perrin:

Heart of the Enlightened can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that
straight away because this book has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge in language, easy
to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the information. The article writer giving his/her
effort to place every word into joy arrangement in writing Heart of the Enlightened but doesn't forget the
main point, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource data that maybe you can be
one among it. This great information may drawn you into completely new stage of crucial imagining.

Shirley Pedro:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is created or printed or created from each source in which filled update of news.
In this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media social
such as newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You can add
your understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just searching
for the Heart of the Enlightened when you desired it?
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