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In Philosophical Fragments the pseudonymous author Johannes Climacus explored the question: What is
required in order to go beyond Socratic recollection of eternal ideas already possessed by the learner?
Written as an afterword to this work, Concluding Unscientific Postscript is on one level a philosophical jest,
yet on another it is Climacus's characterization of the subjective thinker's relation to the truth of Christianity.
At once ironic, humorous, and polemical, this work takes on the "unscientific" form of a mimical-pathetical-
dialectical compilation of ideas. Whereas the movement in the earlier pseudonymous writings is away from
the aesthetic, the movement in Postscript is away from speculative thought. Kierkegaard intended Postscript
to be his concluding work as an author. The subsequent "second authorship" after The Corsair Affair made
Postscript the turning point in the entire authorship. Part One of the text volume examines the truth of
Christianity as an objective issue, Part Two the subjective issue of what is involved for the individual in
becoming a Christian, and the volume ends with an addendum in which Kierkegaard acknowledges and
explains his relation to the pseudonymous authors and their writings. The second volume contains the
scholarly apparatus, including a key to references and selected entries from Kierkegaard's journals and
papers.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Carter:

Here thing why this kind of Kierkegaard's Writings, XII, Volume II: Concluding Unscientific Postscript to
Philosophical Fragments: 002 are different and reliable to be yours. First of all reading a book is good
however it depends in the content of computer which is the content is as tasty as food or not. Kierkegaard's
Writings, XII, Volume II: Concluding Unscientific Postscript to Philosophical Fragments: 002 giving you
information deeper as different ways, you can find any publication out there but there is no book that similar
with Kierkegaard's Writings, XII, Volume II: Concluding Unscientific Postscript to Philosophical
Fragments: 002. It gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your current eyes about the thing in which
happened in the world which is maybe can be happened around you. You can bring everywhere like in area,
café, or even in your way home by train. For anyone who is having difficulties in bringing the imprinted
book maybe the form of Kierkegaard's Writings, XII, Volume II: Concluding Unscientific Postscript to
Philosophical Fragments: 002 in e-book can be your alternate.

Harry Cofield:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the subject Kierkegaard's
Writings, XII, Volume II: Concluding Unscientific Postscript to Philosophical Fragments: 002 suitable to
you? The particular book was written by famous writer in this era. The particular book untitled Kierkegaard's
Writings, XII, Volume II: Concluding Unscientific Postscript to Philosophical Fragments: 002is one of
several books that will everyone read now. This kind of book was inspired lots of people in the world. When
you read this guide you will enter the new shape that you ever know just before. The author explained their
plan in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to know the core of this book. This book will give
you a wide range of information about this world now. To help you to see the represented of the world in this
book.

George Hyler:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the time or they will get
lot of stress from both day to day life and work. So , if we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely
indeed. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity are there when the
spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then ever try this
one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the actual book you have
read is definitely Kierkegaard's Writings, XII, Volume II: Concluding Unscientific Postscript to
Philosophical Fragments: 002.

Thomas Pilcher:

Is it you actually who having spare time and then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs
or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Kierkegaard's Writings, XII,



Volume II: Concluding Unscientific Postscript to Philosophical Fragments: 002 can be the answer, oh how
comes? The new book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this new
era is common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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