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The key to all Wiccan practice is ultimately solitary because developing real growth and awareness begins
inside each individual. The Solitary Wiccan's Bible is for any reader wanting to go deeper into his or her
understanding and experience of Wicca--alone. There are many reasons people seek a solitary path: fear of
charlatans, concern about co-workers finding out or being misunderstood by others, or lack of family or
social support for Wiccan practice.

The Solitary Wiccan's Bible uses the metaphor of a solitary pilgrim walking a path and discovering natural
and spiritual truths along the way. This pilgrimage is based on the ancient symbology of the Pentagram
enclosed in the triple circle. The Solitary Wiccan's Bible leads the pilgrim to cross the circles, moving from
the Wilderness through the Home and Astral realms, to achieve the central Spiritual realm. Always down-to-
earth and easy to understand, The Solitary Wiccan's Bible clearly lays out the Wiccan paths so any reader
can follow.

Chapters include:* The Pilgrimage of Wicca* The Pilgrim Enters New Realms* The Pilgrimage of the
Pentagram* The Pilgrim's Wiccan Magical Path* The Practical Pilgrim's Spellwork* The Pilgrim's
Talismans

The Solitary Wiccan's Bible provides background and practice in clear, accessible, and often humorous
prose, making the book immediately useful to first-time seekers and long-time practitioners alike.
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From reader reviews:

William Pare:

The actual book The Solitary Wiccan's Bible will bring that you the new experience of reading the book. The
author style to spell out the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book to learn, this book very
appropriate to you. The book The Solitary Wiccan's Bible is much recommended to you to see. You can also
get the e-book from your official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Steven Barraza:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this The Solitary Wiccan's Bible publication
written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that could be understand by anyone who
have read the book. Written within good manner for you, leaking every ideas and creating skill only for
eliminate your own hunger then you still doubt The Solitary Wiccan's Bible as good book but not only by the
cover but also by the content. This is one book that can break don't assess book by its protect, so do you still
needing an additional sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already said so why
you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Cynthia Kipp:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book than can
satisfy your short time to read it because all this time you only find e-book that need more time to be
examine. The Solitary Wiccan's Bible can be your answer because it can be read by a person who have those
short extra time problems.

Buddy Beckstead:

This The Solitary Wiccan's Bible is brand new way for you who has interest to look for some information
mainly because it relief your hunger associated with. Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you
know otherwise you who still having bit of digest in reading this The Solitary Wiccan's Bible can be the light
food to suit your needs because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get by means of anyone.
These books produce itself in the form and that is reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book form.
People who think that in guide form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So there is
not any in reading a publication especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here
for you. So , don't miss the item! Just read this e-book kind for your better life as well as knowledge.
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