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`The mass of men lead lives of quiet desperation'

In 1845 Henry David Thoreau left his home town of Concord, Massachusetts to begin a new life alone, in a
rough hut he built himself a mile and a half away on the north-west shore of Walden Pond. Walden is
Thoreau's classic autobiographical account of this experiment in solitary living, his refusal to play by the
rules of hard work and the accumulation of wealth and above all the freedom it gave him to adapt his living
to the natural world around him.

This new edition of Walden traces the sources of Thoreau's reading and thinking and considers the author in
the context of his birthplace and his sense of its history - social, economic and natural. In addition, an
ecological appendix provides modern identifications of the myriad plants and animals to which Thoreau gave
increasingly close attention as he became acclimatized to his life in the woods by Walden Pond.
ABOUT THE SERIES: For over 100 years Oxford World's Classics has made available the widest range of
literature from around the globe. Each affordable volume reflects Oxford's commitment to scholarship,
providing the most accurate text plus a wealth of other valuable features, including expert introductions by
leading authorities, helpful notes to clarify the text, up-to-date bibliographies for further study, and much
more.
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From reader reviews:

Albert Aucoin:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the e-book entitled Walden (Oxford World's Classics). Try to face the book
Walden (Oxford World's Classics) as your buddy. It means that it can being your friend when you sense
alone and beside that course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The
book makes you more confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , let me make new
experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Marlys Wieland:

This Walden (Oxford World's Classics) are generally reliable for you who want to be described as a
successful person, why. The explanation of this Walden (Oxford World's Classics) can be among the great
books you must have is giving you more than just simple reading food but feed a person with information
that possibly will shock your previous knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it everywhere
you go and whenever your conditions both in e-book and printed versions. Beside that this Walden (Oxford
World's Classics) forcing you to have an enormous of experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you
test of critical thinking that we understand it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Melvin Lucero:

The particular book Walden (Oxford World's Classics) will bring one to the new experience of reading a new
book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. In the event you try to find new book to learn, this
book very acceptable to you. The book Walden (Oxford World's Classics) is much recommended to you you
just read. You can also get the e-book through the official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Lavada Rowlett:

This Walden (Oxford World's Classics) is great reserve for you because the content and that is full of
information for you who always deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This particular
book reveal it details accurately using great manage word or we can state no rambling sentences in it. So if
you are read this hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward
sentences but tough core information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having Walden (Oxford World's
Classics) in your hand like finding the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say
that no book that offer you world within ten or fifteen minute right but this publication already do that. So , it
is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt which?
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