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Coma must persist for at least 1 hour to distinguish it from transient unconsciousness. Traumatic and
nontraumatic coma are common problems in pediatric practice with high mortality and morbidity.
Emergency neuroimaging is worthwhile even when etiology is known, as treatable complications, such as
venous sinus thrombosis, as well as extradural and intracerebral hemorrhage, are commonly diagnosed.
There is a wide range of possible etiologies in the previously well child, most of which may be diagnosed
from neuroimaging and laboratory testing available as an emergency, or can be treated presumptively, e.g.,
with antimicrobials for infections. The modified Child's Glasgow Coma Scale (CGCS) for recording depth of
consciousness in children is widely used and should be supplemented by examination for the signs of
reversible central and uncal brainstem herniation due to acute intracranial hypertension. An evidence-based
guideline for the investigation and management of decreased level of consciousness in children, written by
an expert panel using the DELPHI principles, is available. Monitoring and rehabilitation should also be part
of the management plan. Etiology, depth and duration of coma, and serial neurophysiology and imaging are
predictors of outcome in survivors but must be interpreted cautiously. There are no reports of children
meeting adult brain death criteria making good neurological recovery.
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From reader reviews:

Owen Bourne:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the publication entitled Pediatric Neurology Part I: Chapter 5. Coma and brain
death (Handbook of Clinical Neurology). Try to the actual book Pediatric Neurology Part I: Chapter 5. Coma
and brain death (Handbook of Clinical Neurology) as your buddy. It means that it can to become your friend
when you sense alone and beside regarding course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very
fortuned for yourself. The book makes you much more confidence because you can know every thing by the
book. So , let me make new experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Martha Albarado:

The feeling that you get from Pediatric Neurology Part I: Chapter 5. Coma and brain death (Handbook of
Clinical Neurology) will be the more deep you rooting the information that hide in the words the more you
get enthusiastic about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to be aware of but Pediatric Neurology
Part I: Chapter 5. Coma and brain death (Handbook of Clinical Neurology) giving you buzz feeling of
reading. The article author conveys their point in particular way that can be understood through anyone who
read that because the author of this book is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your personal
vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style
are available. We recommend you for having that Pediatric Neurology Part I: Chapter 5. Coma and brain
death (Handbook of Clinical Neurology) instantly.

Sharon Grace:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, short story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not attempting Pediatric Neurology Part I: Chapter
5. Coma and brain death (Handbook of Clinical Neurology) that give your fun preference will be satisfied by
simply reading this book. Reading routine all over the world can be said as the means for people to know
world much better then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading
habit only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants to possibly be success person. So , for every you
who want to start examining as your good habit, you could pick Pediatric Neurology Part I: Chapter 5. Coma
and brain death (Handbook of Clinical Neurology) become your current starter.

Jacqueline Ramos:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our understanding for everything. By a book we can know
everything you want. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This e-book Pediatric Neurology Part I: Chapter 5. Coma and brain death (Handbook of
Clinical Neurology) was filled with regards to science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about



your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has various feel when they reading some sort of book. If
you know how big good thing about a book, you can experience enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era
like currently, many ways to get book that you just wanted.
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