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In When Nationalism Began to Hate, Brian Porter offers a challenging new explanation for the emergence of
xenophobic, authoritarian nationalism in Europe. He begins by examining the common assumption that
nationalist movements by nature draw lines of inclusion and exclusion around social groups, establishing
authority and hierarchy among "one's own" and antagonism towards "others." Porter argues instead that the
penetration of communal hatred and social discipline into the rhetoric of nationalism must be explained, not
merely assumed.

Porter focuses on nineteenth-century Poland, tracing the transformation of revolutionary patriotism into a
violent anti-Semitic ideology. Instead of deterministically attributing this change to the "forces of
modernization," Porter demonstrates that the language of hatred and discipline was central to the way
"modernity" itself was perceived by fin-de-siècle intellectuals.

The book is based on a wide variety of sources, including political speeches and posters, newspaper articles
and editorials, underground brochures, published and unpublished memoirs, personal letters, and nineteenth-
century books on history, sociology, and politics. It embeds nationalism within a much broader framework,
showing how the concept of "the nation" played a role in liberal, conservative, socialist, and populist
thought.

When Nationalism Began to Hate is not only a detailed history of Polish nationalism but also an ambitious
study of how the term "nation" functioned within the political imagination of "modernity." It will prove an
important text for a wide range of students and researchers of European history and politics.
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From reader reviews:

Darren Meekins:

The experience that you get from When Nationalism Began to Hate: Imagining Modern Politics in
Nineteenth-Century Poland is a more deep you searching the information that hide within the words the more
you get considering reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to know but When Nationalism Began to
Hate: Imagining Modern Politics in Nineteenth-Century Poland giving you joy feeling of reading. The copy
writer conveys their point in selected way that can be understood simply by anyone who read it because the
author of this guide is well-known enough. This particular book also makes your vocabulary increase well.
So it is easy to understand then can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We
highly recommend you for having this specific When Nationalism Began to Hate: Imagining Modern Politics
in Nineteenth-Century Poland instantly.

John Lee:

This When Nationalism Began to Hate: Imagining Modern Politics in Nineteenth-Century Poland are
generally reliable for you who want to be described as a successful person, why. The explanation of this
When Nationalism Began to Hate: Imagining Modern Politics in Nineteenth-Century Poland can be one of
several great books you must have is usually giving you more than just simple reading through food but feed
you with information that might be will shock your preceding knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring
it almost everywhere and whenever your conditions both in e-book and printed types. Beside that this When
Nationalism Began to Hate: Imagining Modern Politics in Nineteenth-Century Poland forcing you to have an
enormous of experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that could it useful
in your day task. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Alice Ybarra:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book mainly book entitled When
Nationalism Began to Hate: Imagining Modern Politics in Nineteenth-Century Poland your brain will drift
away trough every dimension, wandering in every single aspect that maybe not known for but surely can
become your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a e-book then become one contact form conclusion
and explanation in which maybe you never get before. The When Nationalism Began to Hate: Imagining
Modern Politics in Nineteenth-Century Poland giving you yet another experience more than blown away
your mind but also giving you useful information for your better life on this era. So now let us show you the
relaxing pattern this is your body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like
winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Christopher Decker:

This When Nationalism Began to Hate: Imagining Modern Politics in Nineteenth-Century Poland is great
guide for you because the content that is certainly full of information for you who always deal with world



and get to make decision every minute. This specific book reveal it information accurately using great
coordinate word or we can say no rambling sentences included. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have
whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight forward sentences but tricky core information with
lovely delivering sentences. Having When Nationalism Began to Hate: Imagining Modern Politics in
Nineteenth-Century Poland in your hand like finding the world in your arm, information in it is not
ridiculous one. We can say that no reserve that offer you world within ten or fifteen small right but this e-
book already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt in
which?
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