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AngularJS is the leading framework for building dynamic JavaScript applications that take advantage of the
capabilities of modern browsers and devices. AngularJS, which is maintained by Google, brings the power of
the Model-View-Controller (MVC) pattern to the client, providing the foundation for complex and rich web
apps. It allows you to build applications that are smaller, faster, and with a lighter resource footprint than
ever before.

Best-selling author Adam Freeman explains how to get the most from AngularJS. He begins by describing
the MVC pattern and the many benefits that can be gained from separating your logic and presentation code.
He then shows how you can use AngularJS's features within in your projects to produce professional-quality
results. Starting from the nuts-and-bolts and building up to the most advanced and sophisticated features
AngularJS is carefully unwrapped, going in-depth to give you the knowledge you need.

Each topic is covered clearly and concisely and is packed with the details you need to learn to be truly
effective. The most important features are given a no-nonsense in-depth treatment and chapters include
common problems and details of how to avoid them.

What you’ll learn

Gain a solid architectural understanding of the MVC Pattern to separate logic, data and presentation code.●

Learn how to create rich and dynamic web apps using AngularJS●

Understand how each feature works and why it is important●

Understand how to extend HTML with declarative syntax●

Learn how to extend and customize AngularJS●

Learn how to test, refine, and deploy your AngularJS projects●

Who this book is for

This book is ideal for web developers who have a working knowledge of JavaScript, HTML and CSS. The
book is platform agnostic and a range of browsers will be presented and discussed throughout the examples.
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From reader reviews:

William Roger:

Book is usually written, printed, or created for everything. You can know everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important point to bring us around the
world. Beside that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A reserve Pro AngularJS (Expert's Voice in
Web Development) will make you to become smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know
about anything. But some of you think this open or reading a new book make you bored. It's not make you
fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or suited book with you?

John Moore:

This Pro AngularJS (Expert's Voice in Web Development) book is just not ordinary book, you have after that
it the world is in your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book is usually information inside this e-
book incredible fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you
will get. This particular Pro AngularJS (Expert's Voice in Web Development) without we realize teach the
one who looking at it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't become worry Pro AngularJS
(Expert's Voice in Web Development) can bring any time you are and not make your carrier space or
bookshelves' become full because you can have it with your lovely laptop even cell phone. This Pro
AngularJS (Expert's Voice in Web Development) having very good arrangement in word along with layout,
so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Sharon Hafer:

Here thing why this specific Pro AngularJS (Expert's Voice in Web Development) are different and
trustworthy to be yours. First of all examining a book is good but it depends in the content than it which is
the content is as tasty as food or not. Pro AngularJS (Expert's Voice in Web Development) giving you
information deeper as different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no guide that similar
with Pro AngularJS (Expert's Voice in Web Development). It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up
your personal eyes about the thing that will happened in the world which is probably can be happened
around you. You can bring everywhere like in playground, café, or even in your method home by train. In
case you are having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of Pro AngularJS (Expert's
Voice in Web Development) in e-book can be your option.

Nancy Brown:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book and
so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new info.
When you read a book you will get new information simply because book is one of a number of ways to
share the information as well as their idea. Second, examining a book will make an individual more
imaginative. When you reading through a book especially fiction book the author will bring someone to



imagine the story how the characters do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to others. When
you read this Pro AngularJS (Expert's Voice in Web Development), it is possible to tells your family, friends
and also soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a book.
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